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JURORS for the JTNP ART EXPO Juried Exhibition 2024 
 
[1] Naomi Brown – Award-winning Southwest artist Naomi Brown is known for her 
dramatic desert landscapes and Western paintings, which have been featured in 
numerous national exhibitions and publications, including Southwest Art Magazine, 
Western Art Collector and American Art Collector magazines, and the cover of 
International Artist Magazine June/July 2023.  A 29 Palms native now living in Arizona, she 
was a first-place winner in the JTNP Art Expo juried exhibition 2021. 
https://www.naomibrownart.com/ 
   
[2] Tim O’Connor – Graphic artist, illustrator, designer, and creator of humorous, political, 
and editorial cartoons for various publications, Tim O’Connor has also painted numerous 
indoor and outdoor murals, including three historic murals in the Oasis of Murals in 
downtown Twentynine Palms and several murals aboard the Marine Corps Air Ground 
Combat Center. O’Connor is a longtime resident artist and owner of O’Connor Graphics & 
Screen Printing in 29.  https://oconnorgraphics.org  
 
[3] Mark Robben – Photographer Mark Robben of Rancho Palos Verdes, CA, has focused 
on capturing the night skies over Joshua Tree National Park in recent years, utilizing digital 
and film photography, and is a previous award winner in the JTNP Art Expo. For his day job, 
he works as a Visual Effects Artist in feature films, commercials, TV, and occasional music 
videos for various post-production facilities in the Los Angeles area. 
www.skylightphotography.net 
 
[4] Anna Stump – Artist and arts educator Anna Stump received her MFA from San Diego 
State University and has been the recipient of international artist residencies, including 
Ireland, France, Mexico, and Senior Fulbright Scholar to the Fine Arts Department at 
Anadolu University in Turkey. She is currently Chair of the Public Arts Advisory Committee 
(PAAC) of the City of Twentynine Palms and owner of Mojaveland artistic mini-golf 
experience. https://www.annastump.com/ 
 
[5] NPS Juror - LeAnne Warren – Park Guide LeAnne Warren is the jury’s representative 
from Joshua Tree National Park, where she works in the visitor centers helping visitors get 
the most out of the park experience and leads talks in the park on its history, geology, flora, 
and fauna. Moving to Joshua Tree in 2019 after a career in broadcast operations, she also 
has been studying at Copper Mountain College and recently resumed creating her artwork. 
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